




Budget, Finance & Audit Committee 
Meeting Record 

(DRAFT) 

 

Meeting Date:  04-02- 2012          Convened:  1:01 p.m.         Adjourned: 2:34 p.m. 
 
Committee Members Present:    
Jerry R. Allen, Chair      
Tennell Atkins, Vice Chair     
Monica Alonzo                                                                     
Ann Margolin  
Scott Griggs    
 
Staff Present:       
Mary Suhm, Jeanne Chipperfield, Ryan Evans, Jack Ireland, Edward Scott, Craig Kinton, Corrine Steeger, 
Wally Waits, Jing Xiao, Lance Sehorn, Tom Perkins, Sally Rodriguez, Carolyn Brescia, Adelia Gonzalez, 
Barbara Martinez, Vernon Young, Leif Sandberg, Debra Johnson-Ojo, Ben Collins, Mike Frosch, Larry 
Calvert, Philip Erwin 
 
AGENDA: 
   
  1.  Approval of the March 5, 2012 minutes 

 Presenter(s):  
 Information Only: ____   
  
 Action Taken/Committee Recommendation(s):   
 A motion was made to approve the March 5, 2012 minutes. Motion passed unanimously. 

        
       Motion made by:  Atkins 

 
Motion seconded by:  Margolin  
 

2. Bond Counsel Contracts 
Presenter(s):  Warren Ernst                                  

      Information Only:       
    
 Action Taken/Committee Recommendation(s): 
 A motion was made to recommend approval of the bond counsel contracts by City Council at the April 

11, 2012 agenda meeting. Motion passed unanimously. 
        
      Motion made by:  Atkins 

 
Motion seconded by:  Margolin 

 

3. Cotton Bowl Proposed 2013 Improvements and Financing 
      Presenter(s):  Paul Dyer, Director, Park and Recreation                                 
      Information Only:              

    
 Action Taken/Committee Recommendation(s):   

A motion was made to move the briefing to full Council on Wednesday, April 4, 2012. Motion passed 
unanimously. 

      
      Motion made by:  Griggs 
       
 
 

 
Motion seconded by:  Alonzo 



Budget, Finance & Audit Committee 
Meeting Record 

(DRAFT) 

 

4. Building Inspection Division: Update and Progress Report 
Presenter(s):  Theresa O’Donnell, Director, Sustainable Development and Construction                                
Information Only:   X         
 
Action Taken/Committee Recommendation(s):   
No action was taken on this item. 
 
FYI: 
 

5. Self Insured Liability and Workers’ Compensation Third Party Claims Administration (TPA) and 
Related Medical Cost Containment Services 
Information Only:            
 
Action Taken/Committee Recommendation(s):   
A motion was made to recommend approval of the contract for workers’ compensation third party 
claims administration (TPA) and related containment services by the City Council at the April 11, 2012 
agenda meeting. Motion passed unanimously. 

      
      Motion made by:  Margolin 
       

 
Motion seconded by:  Griggs 

6. Financial Forecast Report – January 
Information Only:   X     

 
  

    _______________________________________      
Jerry R. Allen, Chair    
Budget, Finance & Audit Committee  







 

The Ethics Advisory Commission’s  

Recommended Amendments to the Code of Ethics 
 

 Clarify that the Ethics Advisory Commission (EAC) may advise the City Council as 

requested and make recommendations concerning the Code of Ethics and ethics policies. 
 

 Clarify that a city official or employee may file an ethics complaint. 
 

 Allow a complainant to bring a complaint based on information and belief. 

 

 Specify what information must be submitted for a complaint to be complete. 

 

 Require the City Secretary to reject incomplete or untimely ethics complaints. 
 

 Require complainants and persons charged in a complaint to provide evidence in a format 

that the City Secretary can duplicate or display. 
 

 Authorize the City Secretary to select randomly another member of the EAC to sit on a 

preliminary panel if the member selected randomly is not available to serve. 
 

 Allow the City Secretary to give written notice to complainants and persons charged in 

complaints by facsimile, email, or first class mail if the person consents. 
 

 Increase the time for a preliminary panel of the EAC to make a finding as to whether a 

complaint states an ethics violation and is supported by just cause from 21 days to 30 

days. 
 

 Increase the time for the EAC to make all reasonable efforts to issue a written decision 

from 45 days to 60 days. 
 

 Clarify that a person who makes a false statement in a hearing before the EAC or a 

preliminary panel is subject to prosecution for perjury. 
 

 Authorize the EAC to determine if a complaint is frivolous. 

 

 Authorize the EAC to prohibit a person who files a frivolous complaint from submitting 

another complaint for: 

 

o up to 2 years for the first frivolous complaint filed in the last 5 years, and 

 
o up to 4 years if the EAC had determined within the last 5 years that the person 

had submitted another frivolous complaint. 
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4/12/12 

ORDINANCE NO.  _____________________ 

An ordinance amending Sections 12A-25, 12A-26, 12A-27, 12A-28, 12A-29, and 12A-38 and 

adding a new Section 12A-40.1 of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF ETHICS,” of the Dallas City 

Code, as amended; requiring the city secretary to reject incomplete or untimely ethics 

complaints; clarifying the advisory duties of the ethics advisory commission; clarifying that a 

city official or employee may file an ethics complaint; specifying what must be submitted for a 

complaint to be complete; allowing a complainant to bring a complaint based on information and 

belief; requiring complainants and persons charged in a complaint to provide evidence in a 

format that the city secretary’s office can duplicate or display; authorizing the city secretary to 

select randomly another member of the commission to sit on a preliminary panel if the member 

selected randomly is not available to serve; allowing the city secretary to give written notice to 

complainants and persons charged in complaints by facsimile, email, or first class mail if the 

person consents; increasing the time for a preliminary panel of the ethics advisory commission 

and the commission to make certain findings and decisions; clarifying that a person who makes a 

false statement in a hearing before the ethics advisory commission or a preliminary panel is 

subject to prosecution for perjury; authorizing the ethics advisory commission to determine if 

complaints are frivolous and sanction those who file frivolous complaints; making certain 

semantic, grammatical, and structural changes; providing a saving clause; providing a 

severability clause; and  providing an effective date. 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DALLAS: 
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SECTION l. That Section 12A-25, “Jurisdiction and Powers,” of Article VII, “Ethics 

Advisory Commission,” of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as 

amended, is amended to read as follows: 

“SEC. 12A-25.     JURISDICTION AND POWERS. 

 

(a) Jurisdiction. The ethics advisory commission shall have jurisdiction to review and 

make findings concerning any alleged violation of this chapter by any person subject to those 

provisions, including but not limited to current city officials and employees, former city officials 

and employees, and persons doing business with the city, if a complaint is filed within one year 

after the date of the alleged violation. The commission may not consider any alleged violation 

that occurred before January 1, 2001 or more than one year before the date of the filing of a 

complaint. The city secretary shall not accept or process any complaint that is filed more than 

one year after the date of the violation alleged in the complaint. 

      (b)      Termination of city official’s or employee’s duties. The termination of a city 

official’s or employee's duties does not affect the jurisdiction of the ethics advisory commission 

with respect to alleged violations occurring prior to the termination of the official’s or 

employee’s official duties. 

      (c)      Powers. The ethics advisory commission has the following powers only: 

            (1)      To establish, amend, and rescind rules and procedures governing its own 

internal organization and operations in a manner and form consistent with this article. 

            (2)      To meet as often as necessary to fulfill its responsibilities. 

            (3)      To request from the city manager through the city council the appointment 

of such staff as is necessary to carry out the duties of the commission. 

            (4)      To review, index, maintain on file, and dispose of sworn complaints. 

            (5)      To make findings of fact as necessary for the disposition of a complaint. 

            (6)      To make notifications, extend deadlines, and conduct investigations. 

(7) To advise the city council as requested on ethical matters and make 

recommendations concerning the city’s ethics code and policies. 

(8) To make determinations that complaints are frivolous and to make 

findings of facts and sanction persons who file frivolous complaints. 

(9) Such other powers as are specifically granted in this chapter or by the city 

council.” 
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SECTION 2. That Section 12A-26, “Complaints,” of Article VII, “Ethics Advisory 

Commission,” of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended, 

is amended to read as follows: 

“SEC. 12A-26. COMPLAINTS. 

      (a)    Filing.  Except for an ethics advisory commission member, a[A]ny resident of the 

city, [or] any person doing business or attempting to do business with the city, or any city official 

or employee at the time the alleged violation of this chapter occurred or the complaint is 

submitted [(other than an ethics advisory commission member)] who believes there has been a 

violation of this chapter may file a [sworn] complaint [, under the penalty of perjury,] with the 

city secretary on a form provided by the city secretary. The complaint must contain the following 

information and items: 

            (1)      The name, address, email address, and telephone number of the 

complainant. 

  (2) The name, address (if known), email address (if known), and telephone 

number (if known) of each [identify the] person [or persons] who allegedly committed the 

violation.[;] 

            (3) A [(2) provide  a] statement of the facts on which the complaint is based, 

including the exact date or dates of the alleged violation.[;] 

            (4) Identification of [(3) to the extent possible, identify] the ethics provision 

or provisions allegedly violated, using either a citation to the applicable section and paragraph of 

this chapter or a description containing substantially the same language as the ethics provision or 

provisions. [; and] 

            (5) Copies of the documents or other evidence, if any, referenced in the 

complaint or in the complainant’s possession that support the complaint attached to the 

complaint. 

  (6) The names, addresses, email addresses (if known), and telephone numbers 

of witnesses, if any, that can offer testimony in support of the complaint.  

  (7) Other [(4) identify] sources of evidence, if any, that the complainant 

recommends should be considered by the ethics advisory commission. 

  (8) An affidavit in which the complainant swears or affirms, under the penalty 

of perjury, that all information submitted in and with the complaint is true and correct or is based 

on the complainant’s information and belief, based on credible evidence, that a violation of this 

chapter has occurred.  
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      (b)     Format of evidence.  If a complainant or a person charged in a complaint submits 

evidence in an electronic, mechanical, or other format that the city secretary’s office cannot 

duplicate or display, the city secretary’s office shall request that person to provide the evidence 

in a format that the city secretary’s office can duplicate or display.  If that person fails to provide 

the evidence to the city secretary’s office in a format that the office can duplicate or display 

within seven days after the office has made a request, then the evidence may not be presented to 

or considered by the ethics advisory commission or a panel of the commission. 

 (c) Acceptance of complaint.  Upon receiving a complaint, the city secretary shall 

determine if it is complete.  A complaint is complete if it contains the information described in 

(a)(1), (2), (3), (4), (5), and (8).  If the complaint is complete, the city secretary shall proceed as 

described in this section.  If the complaint is not complete, the city secretary shall, in writing, 

notify the complainant that the complaint is not complete and state which required information 

was not provided.  The complainant shall have 20 days after the date the city secretary sent 

notice to the complainant to provide the required information to the city secretary.  Otherwise, 

the complaint is deemed abandoned and may not be processed in accordance with this chapter. 

 (d)  Confidentiality.  No city official or employee shall reveal information relating to 

the filing or processing of a complaint, except as required for the performance of official duties 

or as required by law. Ex parte communications by or to members of the ethics advisory 

commission are prohibited by Section 12A-27(c) of this chapter. All papers and communications 

relating to a complaint must be treated as confidential unless required to be made public under 

the Public Information Act (Chapter 552, Texas Government Code) or other applicable law. 

      (e) [(c)]     Notification.  The city secretary shall promptly forward a copy of a complete 

complaint to the chair of the ethics advisory commission and to the person charged in the 

complaint. The person charged in the complaint shall have the opportunity to submit a sworn 

statement, together with such other information he or she feels is relevant. Copies of all 

information provided to the ethics advisory commission by the complainant and the person 

charged in the complaint must be distributed to all parties to the complaint within 10 days after 

the ethics advisory commission receives the information. 

     (f) [(d)]     False accusations and responses. The city secretary shall, in writing, advise the 

person filing the complaint that falsely accusing someone of a violation of this chapter may 

result in criminal prosecution of anyone who knowingly makes a false accusation. The city 

secretary shall, in writing, advise the person charged in the complaint that falsely responding to a 

complaint may result in criminal prosecution of anyone who knowingly makes a false response.   

      (g) [(e)]     Summary dismissal.  

            (1)     Within 30 [21] days after receipt of a complete complaint, either the chair 

or vice chair, selected on a rotational basis and subject to availability, and two commission 

members, selected by lot by the city secretary and subject to availability, shall make a 

preliminary finding as to whether or not the complaint states a claim under this chapter and is 

supported by just cause. "Just cause" means such cause as is found to exist upon a reasonable 

http://www.amlegal.com/nxt/gateway.dll?f=id$id=The%20Dallas%20City%20Code%3Ar%3Ac519$cid=texas$t=document-frame.htm$an=JD_12A-27$3.0#JD_12A-27
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inquiry that would induce a reasonably intelligent and prudent person to believe that a person has 

committed an act or acts constituting an ethical violation under this chapter.   

            (2)     If the preliminary finding is that the complaint does not state a claim under 

this chapter or does not have just cause, based upon the statements and evidence submitted, the 

complaint must be dismissed. A determination that a complaint be dismissed can only be made 

upon the affirmative vote of at least two of the three preliminary panel members. Written notice 

of the dismissal must be sent to both the person who made the complaint and the person about 

whom the complaint was made, identifying the reason or reasons for dismissal.   

            (3)     The chair is recused from serving on a preliminary panel for any complaint 

filed against the mayor, except that the chair may participate in discussions and voting on a 

complaint against the mayor when it is being considered by the commission as a whole. If the 

chair, the vice chair, or both are unable to serve on a preliminary panel, the appropriate number 

of ethics commission members shall be selected by lot by the city secretary as substitutes on the 

panel. The preliminary panel must always have three members.” 

SECTION 3. That Subsection (a), “Evidentiary Hearing,” of Section 12A-27, “Hearing 

Procedures,” of Article VII, “Ethics Advisory Commission,” of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF 

ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended, is amended to read as follows: 

“(a)     Evidentiary hearing. If a complaint is not summarily dismissed under Section 

12A-26(g) [(e)], it will be pursued further at a hearing before the ethics advisory commission. 

Not less than 10 days before the hearing, the city secretary [commission] shall, by certified mail 

or personal service, give written notice of the hearing to both the person who made the complaint 

and the person about whom the complaint was made. If a person entitled to notice under this 

subsection consents in writing, the city secretary may give written notice by facsimile, email, or 

first class U.S. mail.  The notice must state the specific provision or provisions of this chapter 

alleged in the complaint to have been violated, as determined by the preliminary panel.” 

 

SECTION 4. That Subsection (a), “Hearings on Complaints,” of Section 12A-28, 

“Hearing Rules,” of Article VII, “Ethics Advisory Commission,” of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE 

OF ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended, is amended to read as follows: 

“(a)     Hearings on complaints. The rules contained in this section apply to all hearings of 

the ethics advisory commission on complaints not summarily dismissed under Section 12A-26(g) 

[(e)].” 

 



6 

 

SECTION 5. That Subsection (a), “Written Decision,” of Section 12A-29, “Disposition 

of Complaint,” of Article VII, “Ethics Advisory Commission,” of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF 

ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended, is amended to read as follows: 

“(a)     Written decision.  The ethics advisory commission shall make all reasonable 

efforts to issue a written decision within 60 [45] days after receipt of a complete complaint. The 

commission shall state its findings in the written decision. The written decision must either: 

 

(1) dismiss the complaint, with the grounds for dismissal set forth in the 

decision; or 

 

(2)     find that there has been a violation of this chapter and identify in the 

decision the particular provision or provisions violated.” 

 

SECTION 6. That Section 12A-38, “Prosecution for Perjury,” of Article VIII, 

“Enforcement, Culpable Mental State, and Penalties,” of CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF 

ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended, is amended to read as follows: 

“SEC. 12A-38.      PROSECUTION FOR PERJURY. 

 

Any person who knowingly files or makes a false sworn statement under this chapter is 

subject to criminal prosecution for perjury under the laws of the State of Texas.” 

 

SECTION 7. That Article VIII, “Enforcement, Culpable Mental State, and Penalties,” of 

CHAPTER 12A, “CODE OF ETHICS,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended, is amended to add 

a new Section 12A-40.1, “Frivolous Complaints,” to read as follows: 

“SEC. 12A-40.1      FRIVOLOUS COMPLAINT. 

 

(a) Definition.  A frivolous complaint is a complaint that is groundless and brought 

either in bad faith or for the purpose of harassment. “Groundless” means no basis in law or fact. 

 

(b) Order to show cause.  If the ethics advisory commission or a preliminary panel 

has unanimously dismissed a complaint, the commission or panel may, by the affirmative vote of 

at least two-thirds of those present, order a complainant to show cause why the commission 

should not determine that the complaint is a frivolous complaint. 

 

(c) Effect of order to show cause.  Once the ethics advisory commission or a 

preliminary panel has issued an order to show cause to a complainant, the city secretary shall not 

accept or process another complaint from the complainant until the commission has determined 
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whether the complaint is frivolous or the person charged in the complaint has notified the city 

secretary’s office in writing that he or she does not want the commission to determine whether 

the complaint is frivolous. 

 

(d) Confidentiality.  No city official or employee shall reveal information relating to 

the processing of an order to show cause, except as required for the performance of official 

duties or as required by law.  All papers and communications relating to an order to show cause 

must be treated as confidential unless required to be made public under the Public Information 

Act (Chapter 552, Texas Government Code) or other applicable law. 

 

(e) Notification.  The city secretary shall promptly forward a copy of an order to 

show cause to the complainant and the person charged in the complaint. 

 

(f) Response.  The complainant and the person charged in the complaint shall each 

have the opportunity to submit a sworn response, together with such other information he or she 

feels is relevant. The response must be submitted to the city secretary’s office within 10 days 

after the date that the complainant was given written notice of the order to show cause.  Copies 

of all information provided to the ethics advisory commission by the complainant or the person 

charged in the complaint must be distributed to all parties to the complaint within 10 days after 

the commission receives the information. 

 

(g) Format of evidence.  If a complainant or a person charged in a complaint submits 

evidence in an electronic, mechanical, or other format that the city secretary’s office cannot 

duplicate or display, the city secretary’s office shall request that person to provide the evidence 

in a format that the city secretary’s office can duplicate or display.  If that person fails to provide 

the evidence to the city secretary’s office in a format that the office can duplicate or display 

within seven days after the office has made a request, then the evidence may not be presented to 

or considered by the ethics advisory commission or a panel of the commission. 

 

(h) Notice of termination of proceedings.  Instead of submitting a sworn response, the 

person charged in the complaint may notify the city secretary’s office in writing that he or she 

does not want the commission to determine whether the complaint is frivolous.  The notice must 

be submitted to the city secretary’s office within 10 days after the date that the complainant was 

given written notice of the order to show cause.  A copy of the notice provided to the city 

secretary’s office must be distributed to all parties to the complaint within 10 days after the 

commission receives the information.  If the person charged in the complaint submits a timely 

notice to the city secretary’s office, the ethics advisory commission shall take no further action to 

determine whether the complaint is frivolous.    

 

(i) Evidentiary hearing. Unless notice of termination is provided under Subsection 

(h), the ethics advisory commission shall hold a hearing to determine whether the complaint is a 

frivolous complaint.  Not less than 10 days before the hearing, the city secretary shall, by 

certified mail or personal service, give written notice to the complainant and the person charged 

in the complaint of the date, time, and place of the hearing.  If a person entitled to notice under 

this subsection consents in writing, the city secretary may give written notice by facsimile, email, 

or first class U.S. mail. 



8 

 

 

(j) Ex Parte communications.  It is a violation of this section for: 

 

(1) the complainant, the person charged in the complaint, or any person acting 

on their behalf to engage or attempt to engage, directly or indirectly, in any ex parte 

communication about the subject matter of an order to show cause with a member of the ethics 

advisory commission; or 

 

(2) a member of the ethics advisory commission to: 

 

(A) knowingly entertain an ex parte communication prohibited by 

Subsection (j)(1); or 

 

(B) knowingly communicate, directly or indirectly, with any person, 

other than a member of the commission, its staff, or its legal counsel, about any issue of fact or 

law relating to an order to show cause. 

(k) Hearing rules.  Unless otherwise provided in this section, the rules for hearings in 

Section 12A-28 apply to hearings conducted in accordance with this section.   

(l) Rights of the complainant and person charged in the complaint.  The complainant 

and the person charged in the complaint have the right to attend the hearing, the right to make a 

statement, the right to present and cross-examine witnesses, and the right to be represented by 

legal counsel or another advisor. 

 (m) In determining whether a complaint is frivolous, the ethics advisory commission 

may consider evidence of: 

(1) the timing of the complaint with respect to when the facts supporting the 

alleged violation became known or should have become known to the complainant; 

 

(2) the nature and type of any publicity surrounding the filing of the 

complaint; 

 

(3) the existence and nature of any relationship between the person charged in 

the complaint and the complainant before the complaint was filed; 

 

(4) whether the complainant knew or reasonably should have known that the 

allegations in the complaint were groundless; and 

 

(5) the complainant's motives in filing the complaint. 

(n) Determination.  A determination that a complaint is a frivolous complaint can be 

made only upon an affirmative vote of three-fifths of all commission members present and 

voting. Otherwise, the complaint is not deemed frivolous.  A finding that a complaint is frivolous 

must be supported by clear and convincing evidence.  “Clear and convincing evidence” means 
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that measure or degree of proof that produces in a person’s mind a firm belief or conviction as to 

the truth of the allegations sought to be established.  The commission’s determination of whether 

a complaint is frivolous does not affect the prior decision of the commission or preliminary panel 

on the merits of the complaint. 

(o) Sanction for filing a frivolous complaint. 

(1) When the ethics advisory commission determines that a complaint is a 

frivolous complaint, it may prohibit the complainant from filing another complaint alleging one 

or more violations of this chapter for up to: 

(A) two years after the date of the commission’s determination that the 

complaint is frivolous, if the commission had not determined within the preceding five years that 

another complaint filed by the complainant was frivolous; or 

 

(B) four years after the date of the commission’s determination that the 

complaint is frivolous, if the commission had determined within the preceding five years that 

another complaint filed by the complainant was frivolous.   

(2) When determining whether and for how long to prohibit a complainant 

who files a frivolous complaint from filing another complaint under this chapter, the ethics 

advisory commission shall consider the following factors: 

(A) The seriousness of the violation, including the nature, 

circumstances, consequences, extent, and gravity of the violation. 

 

(B) The sanction necessary to deter future violations, including 

whether the violation was an isolated incident or part of a pattern and whether there are any 

mitigating circumstances. 

 

(C) Any other matters that justice may require. 

 

(3) If the ethics advisory commission prohibits the complainant from filing 

another complaint for a specific amount of time under Subsection (o)(1), the city secretary shall 

not accept or process another complaint alleging one or more violations of this chapter from the 

complainant during the time that the complainant is prohibited from filing a complaint.   

 

(4) The ethics advisory commission may notify the appropriate regulatory or 

supervisory agency of its findings and determination, including referring its findings and 

determination to a criminal investigation agency or prosecution entity for investigation of a 

violation of a state or federal law. 

(p) Written decision.  If the ethics advisory commission determines that a complaint 

is frivolous and imposes a sanction, it shall make all reasonable efforts to issue a written decision 

within 15 days after the hearing.  The commission shall state its findings in the written decision. 
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(q) Notification.  Within 10 days after issuing a written decision, the ethics advisory 

commission shall forward copies of the findings and decision to the complainant, the person 

charged in the complaint, the city attorney, the city secretary, the city council, and any member 

of the commission who did not participate in the disposition of the matter.   The city secretary 

shall make copies of the findings and decision available to the public as authorized by law.” 

SECTION 8. That CHAPTER 12A of the Dallas City Code, as amended, will remain in 

full force and effect, save and except as amended by this ordinance. 

SECTION 9. That the terms and provisions of this ordinance are severable and are 

governed by section 1-4 of CHAPTER 1 of the Dallas City Code, as amended. 

SECTION 10. That this ordinance will take effect immediately from and after its passage 

and publication in accordance with the provisions of the Charter of the City of Dallas, and it is 

accordingly so ordained. 

 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

THOMAS P. PERKINS, JR., City Attorney 

 

By ___________________________________ 

     Assistant City Attorney 

Passed ________________________________ 

 

Bowers/DCC/0001 





 
 
 Radio Technology – Procurement and Update   
 
Briefing to the Budget, Finance and Audit Committee 
April 16, 2012  
 



Presentation Objectives 
 
 
  
 • The objective of this presentation is to provide a review of: 

– January 19, 2011 Radio Technology presentation to City Council 
– RFCSP process for additional radio purchases to achieve 

Narrowband requirement 
– Where we are with City / County wide Radio Upgrade 
– Next Steps… 
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Recent Discussions/Council Action on Radio Technology  
 
 
  
 • January 19th, 2011, briefing Council on Radio 

Technology Overview 
 

• January 18th, 2011, briefing to Public Safety on Radio 
Technology Overview 

 

• November 10, 2010, Council authorized a three-year 
master agreement for multi-band and portable subscriber 
radios for public safety Resolution No. 10-2846 
– 850 for Super Bowl and upcoming events 
– 1,150 for additional needs over the three-year period 
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Current City of Dallas Radio System 

4 

• Is not narrowband compliant; FCC requires compliance 
by January 2013 

 
• Citywide radio “system” will need to be replaced to meet 

the current P25 standards;  
 

The system consists of: 
 11,975 Radios 
     700  Receivers 
     400  Antennas 
     250  Transmitters 
       23  Towers 

 
• Is divided into two radio systems: 

– Public Safety  
– Other Public Service Departments (DWU, STS, 

Code, SAN, and AVI) 
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Narrowband 
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Overview of Narrowband 
 What is the purpose of Narrowband? 

 The existing wideband UHF and VHF communication frequencies are congested 
and have limited capacity remaining to expand  

 What is Narrowband? 
 Taking the current wideband frequencies and creating new narrower frequencies in 

order to relieve congestion. 
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FCC “Squeeze in More Talkpaths”...

FCC says: Next Generation, 
date not announced

FCC says: “2-to-1”
January 2013

Currently all of the City’s 
radios operate on this 
wideband frequency

Frequency    
1

Frequency    
2

25 MHz
Wideband

Freq
1

Freq
1

6.25 MHz
Narrowband  

Freq
1

Freq
1

6.25 MHz
Narrowband  

Freq
1

Freq
1

6.25 MHz
Narrowband  

Freq
1

Freq
1

6.25 MHz
Narrowband  

12.5 MHz
Narrowband  

Freq     
1

Freq     
2

12.5 MHz
Narrowband  

Freq     
1

Freq     
2
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Narrow Lanes  

=  

MORE Lanes 
in the same 

space 

NEW 
Technology 

Narrowbanding 
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P25 Standards 
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Overview of P25 
 What is P25? 
 P25 was established by the National Telecommunications & Information 

Administration, Department of Defense and National Security Agency and 
became of paramount importance following 9/11 

 P25 is a technology standard defined by public safety professionals 
 

 What are some of the improvements with P25 technology? 
 P25 improves communications between emergency and non-

emergency service providers 
 More choices with radio communication technologies 
 Digital and analog communication interoperability 
 Resolves over-crowding and congestion of the network 
 Enhanced security of voice and data transmission 
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Timeline for P25 Radio 
System Upgrade 
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Dallas - P25 Radio System Timeline 
Narrowband Radios 

 

 Phase I – Complete Narrowband requirements for Public Safety portable and 
mobile radio devices.  These radios are P25 compliant and will operate with any 
P25 radio system manufacturer.  Target Date: Jan.2013 

 
P25 Radio System Upgrade 

 

 2008/09 – Completed a comprehensive vulnerability assessment of the City’s 
aging radio communication system, and a preliminary outlook of replacement 
alternatives. 

• 2010/11 – Completed an RFCSP and identified a professional engineering firm to serve as 
the City of Dallas’ expert representative in the preparation of technical and functional 
specifications, and implementation oversight for the City’s future P25 radio system. 

 
 Phase IIA – Development of RFCSP: Acquire and document detailed P25 radio 

system configuration / requirements from the City, County and other potential 
cities and agencies.  Target date: Oct.2013 

 Phase IIB – Evaluation of vendor proposals, contract negotiations, and final 
selection. Target Date: Aug.2014 

 Phase III – P25 Radio System Implementation and System Acceptance Testing  
1Q2017 
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2012 
Procurement Process 

for Narrowband Radios 
(P25 Complaint) 
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Procurement Process 

• Business Development and Procurement Services 
(BDPS) conducted a pre-advertisement meeting on 
January 24, 2012 
– Seven vendors attended 

• BDPS advertised a Request for Competitive Sealed 
Proposal (RFCSP) for Single Band and Multiband Radio 
Equipment 
– Dallas Morning News - February 2 & 9, 2012 

• As part of our vendor notification process, 93 electronic 
notices were sent by the City’s web-based procurement 
system 

• Additionally, notifications were sent by BDPS 
ResourceLINK Team (RLT) to 25 chambers of 
commerce, and 2 advocacy groups 
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Procurement Process (cont’d) 

• Pre-proposal conference was held on February 14, 2012 
- 4 companies were represented 

• Motorola Solutions 
• Harris Corporation 
• Lazo Technologies 
• Continental Wireless 

• All questions asked during the pre-proposal meeting were posted on 
the City’s bid website for all potential proposers to review  

• Four proposals were received on February 22, 2012  
• Motorola Solutions 
• Harris Corporation 
• Relm Wireless Corporation 
• Thales Communications, Inc. 
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Procurement Evaluation Criteria  

• Evaluation Criteria 
– Price      30% 
– Performance, Functionality, Personnel      20% 
 Usability & Versatility     
– Business Inclusion & Development Plan 15% 
– Availability of Services & Upgrades  15% 
– Reliability, Compatibility & Expansion 10% 

Capabilities    
– Software Distribution Rights     5% 
– Vendor Qualifications & History of   5% 
    Support       
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Evaluation Process 

• Evaluation committee consisted of employees from the following 
departments: 
– Police (2) 
– Fire-Rescue (1) 
– Communications & Information Services  (1) 
– Water Utilities (1) 
– BDPS (2) – only evaluated the Business Inclusion and Development 

and cost 
• All proposals were reviewed by the evaluation committee to determine 

responsiveness to the minimum requirements  
• All proposers were invited to present additional details of their submission to 

the evaluation team 
• In addition to the presentation, all proposers provided test units to the City 

for live field tests and simulated usage  
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Results 

• Although the City solicited an unbundled  procurement to 
maximize competition, Motorola and Harris provided 
pricing and incentives based on the master agreement 
being awarded in its entirety  

• Based on the initial rankings from the evaluation team, a 
request was made to the two highest ranked proposers 
to provide a Best and Final Offer   

• Motorola and Harris provided revised pricing which was 
utilized to calculate the final overall estimated cost  

• Based on the evaluation summary, Motorola is being 
recommended as the most advantageous proposer with 
the lowest overall cost to the City    
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Scoring and Pricing Summary 
   
*All proposers submitted unit pricing (quantity x unit price to determine estimated contract amounts)

   
 

Highest ranked  1 
Second highest 
ranked  2 

Third highest ranked  3 

No bid for group No Bid  

*Although the City unbundled the procurement to maximize 
competition, Motorola and Harris provided pricing and incentives 
based on the master agreement being awarded in its entirety 

**Thales and Relm were fully evaluated for the groups they 
proposed  

  

Group 1  
Portable Multi-band 
Radio (Handheld) 

Group 2   
Portable Single-band 

Radio (Handheld) 

Group 3 
Mobile Multi-band 
Radio (In Vehicle) 

Group 4 
Mobile Single-band 
Radio (In Vehicle) Total Solution Cost 

Motorola 95.13 91.09 96.60 96.40 $30,342,000* 

Harris 88.60 85.80 77.63 79.23 $34,072,575*  

Thales 58.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,350,000**  

Relm No Bid 64.48 No Bid No Bid $6,111,735**  



Motorola – Evaluation Summary 
• Motorola overall pricing is more advantageous to the City 
• Motorola has next generation narrow banding 

– Harris equipment does not currently have Time Division Multiple Access (TDMA) 
but stated the technology would be available at the end of 2012 

– Dallas would be required to physically touch and program each radio once TDMA 
was made available 

• Estimated cost approximately $300-$400 per device  
• Motorola in-vehicle radio fits well with existing equipment  

– Harris mobile radio protrudes too far out of the current vehicle consoles making 
operation of the other equipment in the vehicle difficult 

– Harris provided an option to split the installation of part of the equipment in the 
trunk which requires additional modifications of the vehicle for an additional cost of 
$266 plus labor 

• Motorola has GPS in radio base  
– Harris has similar technology in their multi-band radio (Public Safety devices) but 

does not in their single-band (civilian devices) 
– Harris single-band radio, GPS technology is within the microphone not the actual 

device.  If the microphone comes loose or off the radio, the City would lose GPS 
capabilities until the microphone was attached   

• Motorola has user friendly menu and buttons  
– Harris menu is difficult to navigate, font size is too small on multi-band portables 
– Harris mobile radio knobs are too close together making it difficult to adjust by 

touch and while wearing protective gear 
19 



Recommendation  

• Approve an action item on the Council’s April 25, 2012 
agenda authorizing a five-year master agreement with 
Motorola in a total amount not to exceed $30,342,000 – 
Financing:  Current Funds ($12,666,097), Water Utilities 
Current Funds ($2,876,980), Homeland Security Grant 
Funds ($14,798,923) 
– This action does not encumber funds; the purpose of a master 

agreement is to establish firm pricing for good or services, for a 
specific term, which are ordered on an as needed basis 
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Group I Scoring -  Portable (Handheld) Multi-band Radio 

Highest ranked  1 
Second highest 
ranked  2 

Third Highest ranked  3 

  Group Cost Cost 

Performance 
and 

functionality, 
personnel 

usability and 
versatility  

Reliability, 
compatibility 

and 
expansion 
capabilities  

Availability 
of Services 

& 
Upgrades  

Software 
Distribution 

Rights  

Vendor 
Qualification 
& History of 

Support  

Business 
Inclusion & 

Development 
Plan  Totals 

Maximum 
Available  
Points 30.00 20.00 10.00 15.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 100.00 

Motorola $13,731,091 28.53 19.00 9.20 13.80 4.60 5.00 15.00 95.13 

Harris $13,041,241 30.00 14.80 8.00 12.60 4.80 4.40 14.00 88.60 

Thales $19,350,000 19.86 9.00 5.00 8.00 4.40 2.40 10.00 58.66 
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Group 2 Scoring – Portable (Handheld) Single-band Radio 

Highest ranked  1 
Second highest 
ranked  2 

Third Highest ranked  3 

  Group Cost Cost 

Performance 
and 

functionality, 
personnel 

usability and 
versatility  

Reliability, 
compatibility 

and 
expansion 
capabilities  

Availability 
of Services 
& Upgrades  

Software 
Distribution 

Rights  

Vendor 
Qualification 
& History of 

Support  

Business 
Inclusion & 

Development 
Plan  Totals 

Maximum 
Available  
Points 30.00 20.00 10.00 15.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 100.00 

Motorola $5,798,318 26.69 17.00 9.00 13.80 4.60 5.00 15.00 91.09 

Harris $5,221,876 30.00 12.80 7.20 12.60 4.80 4.40 14.00 85.80 

Relm $6,111,734 24.88 9.80 4.60 9.00 4.40 3.80 8.00 64.48 



24 

Group 3 Scoring - Mobile (In vehicle) Multi-band Radio 

Highest ranked  1 
Second highest 
ranked  2 

  Group Cost Cost 

Performance 
and 

functionality, 
personnel 

usability and 
versatility  

Reliability, 
compatibility 

and 
expansion 
capabilities  

Availability 
of Services 

& 
Upgrades  

Software 
Distribution 

Rights  

Vendor 
Qualification 
& History of 

Support  

Business 
Inclusion & 

Development 
Plan  Totals 

Maximum 
Available  
Points 30.00 20.00 10.00 15.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 100.00 

Motorola $3,537,778 30.00 18.80 9.40 13.80 4.60 5.00 15.00 96.60 

Harris $5,488,802 19.43 14.60 8.00 12.40 4.80 4.40 14.00 77.63 
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Group 4 Scoring - Mobile (In vehicle) Single-band Radio 

Highest ranked  1 
Second highest 
ranked  2 

  Group Cost Cost 

Performance 
and 

functionality, 
personnel 

usability and 
versatility  

Reliability, 
compatibility 

and 
expansion 
capabilities  

Availability 
of Services 

& 
Upgrades  

Software 
Distribution 

Rights  

Vendor 
Qualification 
& History of 

Support  

Business 
Inclusion & 

Development Plan  Totals 

Maximum 
Available  
Points 30.00 20.00 10.00 15.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 100.00 

Motorola $7,274,813 30.00 18.80 9.20 13.80 4.60 5.00 15.00 96.40 

Harris $10,320,654 21.23 14.60 7.80 12.40 4.80 4.40 14.00 79.23 
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